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Remit Automotive Industry Apprenticeships   

Date: Saturday 28th May 
Time: 10am – 4.00pm 

Location: Remit Automotive Training Academy, 7 Wincanton Close, 
Derby, DE24 8NB 

  
This is will be a great opportunity for those considering a career in the 
automotive industry to come along and see their facilities in their 
academies, which support the practical element of our automotive 
apprenticeship training. 
  
Remit Training (https://remit.co.uk/automotive/) delivers all automotive 
programmes, supporting body and paint, light and heavy vehicle 
specialisms along with non-technical apprenticeships in business 
administration, digital marketing, sales and management, for employers 
that range from independent garages to some of the world leading 
brands. 
  
With high-quality, hands-on training, delivered by some of the best 
trainers in the industry, apprentices spend their training blocks at their 
state of the art training academies throughout their programmes where 
they can use the latest technology, manufacturer tooling and diagnostic 
equipment, share ideas and benefit from an engaging peer-to-peer 
environment with other enthusiastic apprentices. 
  
They currently have a number of live apprenticeship vacancies available 
and members of their Automotive Apprentice Recruitment team will also 
be on hand to explain the process of applying for an apprenticeship this 
summer with one of their clients who represent some of the world’s 
leading Heaving Vehicle manufactures, including Scania, DAF, MAN Truck, 
Volvo and Iveco. 
  
I  hope this will be of interest to some of you, for more information and to 
register an attendance visit https://remit.co.uk/derby-open-day/ or call 
the Remit Automotive Recruitment Team on 0115 975 9550  

 


